
LECTURER, QUANTITATIVE METHODS IN PSYCHOLOGY. The Department 
of Psychology at the University of Georgia (www.uga.edu/psychology) is seeking to fill a 
Lecturer position beginning fall 2022. This position is a nine-month position that is 
renewable and promotable within the Lecturer track at UGA.  
 
A Ph.D. in Psychology or a related field is required. The successful candidate will be 
expected to cover a variety of core undergraduate courses, including quantitative methods 
(e.g., undergraduate research methods and statistics) and some graduate courses.  
 
The University of Georgia (UGA), a land-grant and sea-grant university with statewide 
commitments and responsibilities, is the state’s oldest, most comprehensive, and most 
diversified institution of higher education (https://www.uga.edu/). UGA is currently 
ranked among the top 15 public universities in U.S. News & World Report. The 
University’s main campus is located in Athens, approximately 65 miles northeast of 
Atlanta, with extended campuses in Atlanta, Griffin, Gwinnett, and Tifton. UGA was 
founded in 1785 by the Georgia General Assembly as the first state-chartered University 
in the country. UGA employs approximately 1,800 full-time instructional faculty and 
more than 7,700 full-time staff. The University’s enrollment exceeds 39,000 students 
including over 30,000 undergraduates and over 9,000 graduate and professional students. 
Academic programs reside in 18 schools and colleges, as well as a medical partnership 
with Augusta University housed on the UGA Health Sciences Campus in Athens. 
 
The Franklin College of Arts and Sciences, its many units, and the University of Georgia 
are committed to increasing the diversity of its faculty and students, and sustaining a 
work and learning environment that is inclusive. Women, people from historically 
excluded groups, and people with disabilities are encouraged to apply.  
 
Candidates should apply at https://www.ugajobsearch.com/postings/248833 and include a 
curriculum vitae; statement of teaching experience and interests; and a statement that 
addresses past, current, or potential future contributions to diversity and inclusion. 
Candidates will be asked to provide the names and email for three references who can 
provide letters of recommendation. The letters will be requested later in the process from 
the individuals you identify here. All applications received by April 18, 2022 will receive 
full consideration. Review will continue until the position is filled. 
 
The University of Georgia is an Equal Opportunity/Affirmative Action employer. All 
qualified applicants will receive consideration for employment without regard to race, 
color, religion, sex, national origin, ethnicity, age, genetic information, disability, gender 
identity, sexual orientation or protected veteran status. Persons needing accommodations 
or assistance with the accessibility of materials related to this search are encouraged to 
contact Central HR (hrweb@uga.edu). 


